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From: Cameron Bell

To: Brown. Jeffrey
Subject: FW: River House
Date: Monday, July 6, 2020 1:44:41 PM

Cameron C. Bell

Realtor | Broker | Attorney*
Cameron Bell Properties, Inc.
14335 Dedeaux Road

Gulfport, MS 39503

col I

Fax (800) 520-3445
www.cameronbellproperties.com

*Not actively practicing law.

From: Steven palazzo <

Sent: Tuesday, April 3, 2018 9:37 PM

Tos: Cameron te!l

Subject: RE: River House

Not at this time. I'm trying to get the basic renovations done and things spruced up and that would
only further delay me.

From: Cameron e/

Sent: Tuesday, April 03, 2018 3:56 PM

Tos Steven alazzo [

Subject: River House

| was contacted today by a gentleman whose wife is a Realtor at Coldwell Banker. They have been
“eye-balling” the house for a while now, and would like to discuss a short term lease option to make
sure it will work for them before purchasing. Allegedly they have their loan pre-approved, but don’t
want to make a $500K+/- mistake. He sounds pretty sharp. Do you want to go down this road?

Cameron C. Bell

Realtor | Broker | Attorney
Cameron Bell Properties, Inc.
14335 Dedeaux Road

Gulfport, MS 39503

col

Fax (800)520-3445
www.cameronbellproperties.com

20-2124_1487
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From: Cameron Bell

To: Brown Jeffr
Subject: FwW:
Date: Monday, July 6, 2020 1:44 55 PM

Cameron C Bell

Realtor | Broker | Attorney*

Cameron Bell Properties, Inc

14335 Dedeaux Road

Gulfport, MS 39503

Cell

Fax (800) 520-3445

https://urldefense proofpoint com/v2/url?u=http-

3A__ www cameronbellproperties com&d=DwIFAwW&c=L93KkjKsACI8UTVCA4KvQDATDRzAeWDDRmMG6S3Y XIIH0&r=YVZxpS6BS7cXGBCP7bKmUbj2uw9fdJ00rl_iz_ RDN2Y &m=N7Nf2-
Tthq7wHy_t47-Aj-tpuxmDPavewFzXCub_uNo&s=2KNCZMiBri5ZW4UlfbHaxLZblBe26secFxeY4e_97rA&e=

*Not actively practicing law

From: Steven Palazzo >
Sent: Tuesday, March 13, 2018 9:15 PM

To: cameronbel

Subject:

This week lawn care starts on river house Pressure washing walls Have
you gotten any calls?

Sent from my iPhone
This email has been checked for viruses by AVG
https://urldefense proofpoint com/v2/url?u=https-

3A__ www avg com&d=DwIFAw&c=L93KkjKsACI8uTVC4KvQDdTDRzAeWDDRMG6ES3Y XIIHO&r=YVZxpS6BS7cXGBCP7bKmUbj2uw9fdJ00rl_iz_ RDN2Y &m=N7Nf2-Tthq7wHy_t47-
Aj-tpuxmDPavewFzXCub_uNo&s=mmjy0Opius|72PeRZHICbUwQpTrYJbgR47Z10SCvJjyk&e=

20-2124_1490
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From: Dylan Mears

To: Jacque Soileau

Cc: Paul Breazeale; Steven Palazzo
Subject: RE: Checks

Date: Tuesday, August 14, 2018 2:08:58 PM
Attachments: image001.jpg

20180814 142113.pdf
20180814 142152.pdf

Ms. Jacque,

Attached is the bills and checks that | will be sending today. There are bills for the PAC aswell as
PFC.

Regards,

Dytan Mears

Staff Accountant

Palazzo & Company, LLC
P.O. Box 6888

Gulfport, MS 39506
228-396-8800 Office
866-272-9224 Toll Free
228-207-5138 Fax

PalazzoTaxlogo_color_low

I.E_

WWW.PALAZZOTAX.COM

CONFIDENTIALITY: This message (including any attachments) contains confidential information intended for a specific
individual and purpose, and is protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient, you should delete this message. Any
disclosure, copying, or distribution of this message, or the taking of any action based on it, is strictly prohibited.

From: Jacque Soileau |G-
Sent: Tuesday, August 14, 2018 11:40 AM
To: Dylan Mears <}
ce: Paul Breazeale < G

Subject: RE: Checks

Would it be possible to scan the check copies with the invoices in a stack and then tear off the stubs
to prepare to mail and we just get what needs to be mailed? That way we will not have two sets of
paper files. We will save the scans.

Please use the street address below for FedEx.

Thanks.

Jacque

Jacque T. Soileau

Office Manager

Breazeale, Saunders & O'Neil, Ltd.

120 North Congress Street, Suite 300 (39201)
Post Office Box 80

Jackson, Mississippi 39205

20-2124_1523

THSP_0385
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From: Steven Palazzo

To: Jacque Soileau

Cc: Dylan Mears; Paul Breazeale
Subject: Re: PFC Reports

Date: Saturday, April 14, 2018 2:55:16 PM
Attachments: image001.jpg

INN should be consulting not research

USPS should be postage not meals

Quality Seafood should be law enforcement donation not whatever was listed
Sigma Chi should be donation not advertising

Those are the ones that popped up.

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 13, 2018, at 5:29 PM, Jacque Soil eau ||| G ot

Dylan and Steven

Attached are draft reports that is due on Sunday. We will upload on Sunday. Please
review and let us know if you have any changes. If we do not hear from you we will go
ahead and upload on Sunday afternoon.

Thanks.

Jacque

Jacque T. Soileau

Office Manager

Breazeale, Saunders & O'Neil, Ltd.

120 North Congress Street, Suite 300 (39201)
Post Office Box 80

Jackson, Mississippi 39205

Telephone: (601) 969-7440

Mobile:
Facsimile: (601) 355-9003

E-mail: jsoilea
Circular 230 Disclosure: To ensure compliance with Treasury Department Regulations, we inform you that, unless

specifically indicated otherwise, any tax advice contained in this message, including any attachments, was not intended
or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or
applicable state or local law provisions or (ii) promoting, marketing or recommending to another party any transaction
or matter addressed herein.
THE INFORMATION TRANSMITTED IS INTENDED FOR VIEWING ONLY BY THE ADDRESSEE, AND MAY
CONTAIN CONFIDENTIAL AND/OR PRIVILEGED MATERIAL. ANY REVIEW, RETRANSMISSION, DISSEMINATION
OR OTHER USE OF, OR TAKING OF ANY ACTION IN RELIANCE UPON, THIS INFORMATION BY PERSONS OR
ENTITIES OTHER THAN THE INTENDED RECIPIENT IS PROHIBITED. IF YOU HAVE RECEIVED THIS MESSAGE
AND YOU ARE NOT THE INTENDED RECIPIENT, PLEASE CONTACT THE SENDER AT 601-969-7440 AND
DELETE THE MATERIAL IMMEDIATELY AND DO NOT RETAIN A COPY. THANK YOU!

From: Oyl Vicars -

Sent: Monday, April 9, 2018 2:55 PM

To: Jacque Soileau ||| G-

20-2124_1525

THSP_0462



ce:Steven Palazzo [

Subject: PFC Reports
Ms. Jacque,

Please see the attached reports for the campaign 1% quarter.

Regards,

Dytan Mears

Staff Accountant

Palazzo & Company, LLC

P.O. Box 6888

Gulfport, MS 39506

228-396-8800 Office

866-272-9224 Toll Free

228-207-5138 Fax

<imageOO01.jpg>

WWW.PALAZZOTAX.COM

CONFIDENTIALITY: This message (including any attachments) contains confidential information intended for a
specific individual and purpose, and is protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient, you should
delete this message. Any disclosure, copying, or distribution of this message, or the taking of any action
based on it, is strictly prohibited.

<Palazzo 04.15.18 Draft FEC Report.pdf>

<Patriot PAC 04.15.18 Draft FEC Report.pdf>

20-2124_1526

THSP_0463
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@& COVID-19 resources & funding > X

Issue Refund

J——————

Send Receipt f

e

$645.18 Payment

Dec. 10, 2018 12:46 pm

Collected at: Pounds Plumbing

Source: Virtual Terminal

Custom Amount $645.18

Note: Kyle Palazzo

TOTAL $645.18

American Express- $645.18
Dec. 10, 2018 12:46 pm
Receipt #shJH

$622.45 Transferred
Fees: Virtual Terminal 3.50% + $0.15 ($22.73)

20-2124_1528

PP_0007
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Invoice

y ] %%%ﬁ 12/4/2018 62093

23414 Hwy 49
Saucier, MS 39574

Y
Bill To _ ,\G.?'ﬁ Job Location
Kyle Palazzo AT
11072 0ld Hwy 67
Description Amount
Labor 380.00

Changed out and set floats in grinder pump

Rebuilt inside toilet tank

Materials 201.72
Office # E-mail Sales Tax (7.0%) $40.72

20-2124 11531

Total $627.44  PP000S

77Q.520.Q0Q7 nonndenhimbin o |




Page 1 of 1

_ Invoice 62093 from Pounds Plumbing, Inc.
~ poundsplumbing to: rick.tubertini, anthony 06/24/2020 09:06 AM

From: <poundsplumbing
To: <rick.tubertini . <anthony ||| G

1 Attachment

S

A

:L‘

Inv_62093_from_Pounds_Plumbing_Inc. 13800.pdf

N

Pounds Plumbing, Inc.

invoice rue r2w4201
522;,; Amount Due: $OOO

Dear Kyle Palazzo :

Your invoice is attached. Please remit payment at your earliest convenience.
Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,

Pounds Plumbing, Inc.
228-539-8087

20-2124_1532

file:///C/Users/rtubertini/AppData/l ocal/ Temn/Omotes7TBCEF4AR/~weh7912 htm £/28/20» () PP_0006
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Invoice
23414 Hwy 49
Saucier, MS 39574

Bl To %&%»%%%ﬁ 10/19/2018 61727

' .1‘ Job Location

Kyle Palazzo " Al

11072 Old Hwy 67

Description Amount
Labor 95.00
Changed out garbage disposal
Materials 70.00
Subtotal $165.00
Office # E-mai | Sales Tax (7.0%) $11.55
20-2124_1534
Total
727R-85230_-QNK7 i nn11nr10nlnmkh-\n_

‘R‘l 7A oR PP_0601



Page 1 of 1

Invoice 61727 from Pounds Plumbing, Inc.
x? poundsplumbing to: rick.tubertini, anthony 06/24/2020 09:05 AM

From: <poundsplumbing
. <anthony ||

To: <rick.tubertini
I Attachment

Inv_61727 from_Pounds_Plumbing_Inc. 13800.pdf

Founds Plumbing, Inc.

Invoice oue 1oz
61;127 Amount Due: $OOO

Dear Kyle Palazzo :

Your invoice is attached. Please remit payment at your earliest convenience.
Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,

Pounds Plumbing, Inc.
228-539-8087

20-2124_1535

file://7C:/Users/riubertini’ AppData/Local/ Temn/9/motes TRCEAR /—weh0938 him AR 0 PP_0002



EXHIBIT 80

222222222222



P

&2 COVID-19 resources & funding »

Send Receipt

[ %
Pl Issue Refund [

$183.11 Payment

Oct. 17, 2018 4:54 pm

Collected at: Pounds Plumbing
Source: Virtual Terminal

Custom Amount $183.11

Note: Kyle Palazzo

TOTAL $183.11

American Express - $183.11
Oct. 17, 2018 4:54 pm

Receipt #nTem

$176.55 Transferred
Fees: Virtual Terminal 3.50% + $0.15 ($6.56)

20-2124_1537

PP_0003



Square Receipt Page 1 of 1

Receeipt from Pounds Plumbing

- Pounds Plumbing via Square to: rick.tubertini 06/24/2020 08:57 AM

From: Pounds Plumbing via Square <

To: ~:|ick1ubcrlini*

Please respond to Pounds Plumbing via Square

<CAESKBIAGhpyX29¢Z3RIbWvZ2ZtZnF xMmVsamhl Y 3IrMilIZGIhbGInd WU ID6VPYTCIPEIMIREbWemFFLIFMefvRydgXAqC2ZFSP VK @reply2.square

Pounds Plumbing
N

How was your expenence?

"183.11

Custom Amount $183.11

Kyle Palazzo

Total £$183.11

Pounds Plumbing

Enlem

Auath code -

Square Just Got More Rewarding
Your favorite businesses may sond v

news anad rewards via Square. Lo

Receipt Settings

Iiot vour receipt?  Mansge preference

20-2124_1538

file:///C:/Users/rtubertini/ AppData/Local/ Temn/9/motes TRCEAB /~weh0433 him 6/28/207() PP_0004
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20-2124_1562

BHAC_0001



20-2124_1563

BHAC_0002



20-2124_1564

BHAC_0003



20-2124_1565

BHAC_0004



20-2124_1566

BHAC_0005
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017901

( CHECK LIST

COMPRESSOR
:I SUCTION ___ PSI
HEAD__ PSI

NES . —~ N ﬂ?—r-_, l ‘\
7616 MARATHON DR. * BILOXI, MS 39532 8 TQ ;Ug;/nﬂa’_

! (228) 392-5092 FAX (228) 392-5937 / /

CONTACTOR TiGHT A CLEAN YN
QIL LEVEL & CONDITION

10T [ S AMPS
E ELECTRICAL CONNECTIONS
(] suanouT OATE GCHEDULED

(7] CONDENSER COIL - =) NAME e a [..f.-'t 220 /L [/

CLEAN COIL & CHLCK FIN COND ] EE
" REFRIGERANT 1 S ) () oy (o 7 e
_J Ak [ ] CHAKGE l - - — 8T, 'T‘E;C ZIP | Pi¥. OR CELL
FAN AND MOTOR / = _ Jey . / /' | § iﬁ |
= ] " | ( . < /)/( SEATAL NUMBER £

YOLTS ANIPS

CLECTRICAL CONNLCTIONS f"“ X / . 4. _ MAKE MODEL | . WARRANTY
CONTACTS TIGHT & CLEAN ’ > | ] _ _ [ — — CONTRACT
(] FAN PULLEYS (ADJUIST BELT) ‘ L )4 ‘ /] 5 w h i [ SERVICE COMTRACT
(] CHECK. LUBE BEARINGS & MOTOR — - .| j  NORMAL
(] cem — ' [ RES [ COMM.
EVAPORATOR COIL | | T | 08 | = .
oo o Fveoa __ DESCRIPTION OF WORK | Z=CSERVICE

5] Ewﬂﬁ;ﬁ?;nﬁ; T 1 | B e éﬁ‘ch ce L(DS \5’/6’41( ] +c/m Mf € {57 s ﬂ
R RS | O Ge ~ [’LA,, //\e,,m stz *ﬁ :
Clecks q o

(] CLEANED REPLACED ;- o . s f7(/

ol m— e s e —

FILTER SIZE 4 '
HEATING ASSY. }L D ,/ / + :
BURNER & HEAT EXCHANGER I € %) ﬂ eé -_ (' L 1% </ l..f’ i ,97) C/ 0 /1 ( . :
FUEL SUPPLY & PRESSURE | ’{/ :
PILOT ASSEMBLY - 1 ,ch S({S (S‘ a1 e Z ;0 q
] FLAME ADJUSTMENT “/, . |
PRIMARY RELAY & FLUE 444 é‘.\' — 0 Ldﬂ ?3 ﬂw 1\141 d\g 4 ; |
FAN & LIMIT SWITCH OPER T ' } _ N |
BLOWER ASSENBLY TOTAL PARTS ' [{ ca L (eAC [\ A [ Ohce 70 79 |
__| RV VALVE c| WRITE OR CODE AMOUNT ‘ . : l
SNPIRAY PARTS WARRANTY A ¢ (L',T c_ P m MC) 5 ‘(/ d ﬂ ( : |
DEFROST CYCLE All parts as recordad are warranted as per |A ' 1
r a G !
[ ELECTRICAL COMP’TS.| manufacturer specifications. E 5[ 1_4 G / l‘g S : ﬂ C)
RELAYS CONTACTORS | LABOR GUARANTY S j‘—ﬂ( / 5 ; e
[] OVERLGAD PRESS SWITCH The labor charge as recorded here relative lo the | TECH REGULA E{ HR S I:..FTT'IME :
—] THERMOSTAT equipmont serviced as noled, is guarantoed for a | : HRS. @ MR. = £ HA =
] 0K REPLACE period of 30 days. M[ KLILN MACH USAGL 3 TECH REGULAR T OVERTIME |
RELOCATE We do not, of course, guaranty other parts than those - HRS. @ P u HARS I <
r ——— we supply. If repairs later become nocessary due to E ; Ve E @ R
TRAVEL TIME | olher defective parts, they will be charged separately. |L TOTAL TECHNICIAN . CERT.# TOTAL :
- lw| OTHER CHARGES |5 SIGNATURE o gmgg o .3 {:)O
ARAVED — ENVIRONMENT CHECK LIST N . Yo AR ° SuB- | 2K OD
F— - l.li': r 1
GEPAATED el ST g G ouron | HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO ORDER THE ABOVE WORK AND DO SO LAl é—-ig"’ ' f :
- i - CODE|permiG. arTy. .';. O |REPLACED)? ~ i ORDER AS OUTLINED ABOVE. IT IS AGREED THAT THE SELLER WILL ,
%ﬁgﬂ E: ' YES NO_ RETAIN TITLE TO ANY EQUIPMENT OR MATERIAL FURNISHED UNTIL :
£ \ ‘ 4 lois: FINAL & COMPLETE PAYMENT IS MADE, AND IF SETTLEMENT IS NOT bl
[ MILEAGE @ |RECOVERED? S 5 QTY. by :‘ MANTLED? | ___ |} MADE AS AGREED, THE SELLER SHALL HAVE THE RIGHT TO CJ:‘LF;E ;
o i g YES NO REMOVE S N THE SELLER WILL BE HELD HARMLESS FOR -
ENDING o D | E |REFRIGERANT DISPOSAL ANY DAMAGES| RESULTING/FRON THE REMOVAL THEREOF. ' . '
@ |RecycLED? arv. ; TAX 4 ;
i Y .2 T @ +
| sTART~ o| OUR PERSONNEL - ' :
6 | @ |RECLAIMED? ary. 5| RECOMMEND: '
'oT MILES ;' d
LTRSS A v 7 =
5 .,. o Lol o . By 73
o —— X MR.= 5 | @ |DISPOSAL R p— AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE
' ABOVE ORDERED WORK HAS BEEN COMPLETED AND | ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF MY COPY. H-NI
L x v (vowvsesss [ L] RS TS oare :
Bl TRIP T YES NO ary.
o\ CHARGE $ | ® |bisposaL X J
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71537 DONAYD B DUFEEY

] COMPRESSOR

[:J SUCTION __ Psi
[_[ HEAD PS|
VOIS o AMPS

] ELECTRICAL CONNECTIONS

(] CONTACTOR TIGHT & CLEAN YA

L) oW LEVEL & CONDITION

BURN OUT

CONDENSER COIL
] CLEAN COIL & CHICK FIN COND.
ENY__ . __FWVG__ __F

| REFRIGERANT

LEAK [ ] cHanGE

FAN AND MOTOR

(] vouts AMPS

r ELECTRICAL CONNECTIONS
CONTACTS TIGHT & CLEAN

(] FAN PULLEYS (ADJUST BELT) .
() CHECK. LUBE BEARINGS & MOTOR

] cam__
1 EVAPORATOR COIL

CLEAN COIL & CHECK FIN
[(Jentos __ 'F|WGDB ___F
ENT WE Flivawea ___F
CONDENSATE AREAS
INSFECT & CLEAN DRAIN PAN
INSPECT & CLEAN DRAIN

AlIR FILTERS
CLEANED REPLACED

FILTE® SIZE
[] HEATING ASSY.
BURNER & HEAT EXCHANGER
(] FUEL SUPPLY & PRESSURE
FILOT ASSEMBLY

FLAME ADJUSTMENT
PRIMARY RELAY & FLUE

[T] FAN & LINIT SWITCH OPER.

[ ] BLOWER ASSEMBLY

(] RV VALVE

STRIFP HEAT

DEFROST CYCLE

| ——

RELAYS CONTACTORS
OVERLOAD PRESS SWITCH

(1 THERMOSTAT
O.K [[] REPLACE
RELGCATE

AMDUNT

ELECTRICAL COMP'TS.

Qf’o

HEAT & AIR INC.

7616 MARATHON DR. « BILOXI, MS 29532
(228) 392-5092 FAX (228) 392-5937

NAME

STR

:}if;f

CITY

( A#D'ELe %ﬁ SERIRzUéEH

;, WARRBANTY

CONTRACT

NOAMAL

JOB
LOCATIGN

(=
J
[ SERYVICE CONTRACT
L - RES __ COMM.

e e el —————

PARTS WARRANTY

TOTAL PARTS

MOUNT

All parts as recorded are warranted as per

manufacturer specilications.
LABOR GUARANTY

The labor charge as recorded here relative to the
equipment serviced as noted, is guaranteed for a

period of 30 days.
We do not, of course, guaranty other parts than those
we supply. if repairs later become necessary due to

TIME
ARRIVED

TIME
DEPARTED

TRAVEL
TIME -

|
- TRAVEL_ TIME __| other defective paris, they will be charged separately.

'ET:n-rnm TE0OITN UMODIPIO

!

| OTHER CHARGES |g

HL! LA MACH, USAGE

TOTAL

ENVIRONMENT CHECK LIST

Hﬁ

|CHRG.| TYPE SYSTEM

e P Qry.

CHANGED
OUT (OR
REPLACED)?

DIS-

Qry.

MILEAGE

1Bl @ AHECOVEFEED? l:]
4

ENDING

STARTF—

T 0 MILES

X

QrTy.

MANTLED?

@ |RECYCLED? E___J

QrTy.

SEEY 1352 BEC ND TXJIE659 '.ng

- ZmMETv—Com

®

YES

NO

YES

AEFRIGERANT DISPOSAL

NO

m—

OUR PERSONNEL
RECOMMEND:

©) iHEGLAIMED? )

RETURNED TO

ary.

1
1
4
|
|
1

— - R — = —

G
L__.l""-———————J = THIS SYSTEM? f_—_l

R (= YES

A

N

T

@ #DISPOSAL

NON USEABLE I:I :I ary.

YES NO

~DCNALDS O

QWNER'S

INITIALS

ACCEPTED

® lDISF‘OSAL

DECLINED

A
=
“3

TECH ~ REGULAR

#1 HRS. @ IHR. tHE.

@

1]

l

|

OVERTIME
IH FL =

HRS.
@

M ——DmM<O

g TECH REGULAR ‘
4 e

HRS. @ HR.

il

OVERTIME *
MHR. = i

TECHNICIAN ﬂ : CERT. #

SIGNATURE ée__,,.

e = T PR n '8 AHME ) '
| HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO ORDER THE ABOVE WORK AND DO SO
ORDER AS OUTLINED ABOVE. IT IS AGREED THAT THE SELLER WILL
RETAIN TITLE TO ANY EQUIPMENT OR MATERIAL FURNISHED UNTIL
FINAL & COMPLETE PAYMENT IS MADE, AND IF SETTLEMENT IS NOT
MADE AS AGREED, THE SELLER SHALL HAVE THE RIGHT TO
REMOVE SAME AND THE SELLER WILL BE HELD HARMLESS FOR
ANY DAMAGES RESULTING FROM THE REMOVAL THEREOF.

: = - '...1:" -
3 Nl

TOTAL ‘

OTHER g >

G ss Js5 oo
suB- | ' :

TOTAL ;[_D ; @

- TRIP
CHARGE

w | 197D

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

X

9747

ABOVE ORDERED WORK HAS BEEN COMPLETED AND | ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF MY COPY. DATE/

e s e T T e e T L R TR T el
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